AD. 1962]

TAX (AMENDMENT) [No. 8

13

I assent.
R. F. A. GREY

Governor.

Sth June, 1962.

ORDINANCE NO. 8 OF 1962.

TAX (AMENDMENT) ORDINANCE, 1962.

Section

O 00 1Ot =

10.
11.
12.

Arrangement of Sections.

Short title.

Amendment of section 3 of Chapter 298.

Amendment of section SA of Chapter 298.

Amendment of section 9 of Chapter 298.

Repeal and re-enactment of section 28 of Chapter 298.
Amendment of section 29 of Chapter 298.
Amendment of section 30 of Chapter 298.

Amendment of section 39 of Chapter 298.

Repeal and re-enactment of section: 42 of Chapter 298.
Repeal and re-enactment of section 45 of Chapter 298.
Transitional provisions.

Commencement.

AN OrpiNANCE to amend the Tax Ordinance.

[9th June, 1962

Enacted by the Legislature of British Guiana:—

1. This Ordinance may be cited as the Tax (Amendment) Short tite.
Ordinance, 1962, and shall be construed and read with the Tax Ordi- <% %
nance, hereinafter referred to as the Principal Ordinance, and any

Ordinance amending the same.

A.D. 1962.

2.(1) TParagraph (a) of subsection (1) of section 3 of the Principal Amendment

Ordinance is hereby amended by the substitution for the words “nine
dollars and sixty cents” of the words “fourteen dollars and forty cents”. 298

(2) Where duty on any rum or other spirits has become pay-
able under paragraph (a) of subsection (1) of section 3 of the Principal
Ordinance prior to the date of commencement of this section but had
not been paid prior to such date, the duty to be raised, levied -and

collected on such rum and other spirits shall be at the rate specified in
the said paragraph as amended by subsection (1) of this section.

of section 3



14 No. 8] THE LAWS OF BRITISH GUIANA [AD. 1962

i 35 Section 5A of the Principal Ordinance is hereby amended
of Chapter by the substitution for the words “seventy-five cents” of the words

“one dollar and forty cents”.

of section's 4, Section 9 of the Principal Ordinance is hereby amended-

o hepcs (a) by the substitution for the figures “O 36” in paragraph
(1) of the figures “0 507;

(b) by the substitution for the figures “0 24” in sub-para-
graph (a) of paragraph (2) of the figures “1 007;

(c) by the deletion of sub-paragraphs (a) and (b) of para-
graph (35) and by the insertion of the following:—
“35(a) Receipt, including any note, memorandum, or

writing whatsoever or any duplicate thereof,
whereby any money is acknowledged or ex-
pressed to have been received, or deposited,
or paid or whereby any debt or demand or
any part of a debt or demand is acknowledged
to have been settled, satisfied or discharged, or
which signifies or imports that acknowledg-
ment and whether signed or not signed with
the name of any person where the sum —
$ ¢
amounts to $10 but is less than
$250 T 0 05
amounts to $250 but is less than
$1,000 - 0 25
amounts to $1,000 and over .. 1 00~

Repeal and Sx Section 28 of the Principal Ordinance is hereby repealed

of section9g and the following substituted therefor —

ggs Chapter

' [ Pawnbrokers 28, Every person who carries on the business
icence.

of a pawnbroker shall take out an annual
licence for so doing and pay for the licence if
carrying on such business in Georgetown, or
within ten miles thereof, the sum of seven hun-
dred and fifty dollars and if carrying on the
business in New Amsterdam or within  ten
miles thereof, the sum of four hundred dollars
and if carrying on business elsewhere the sum
of one hundred and twenty dollars.”

ey 6. Section 29 of the Principal Ordinance is hereby amended
of Chapter by the substitution for the words “one hundred and fifty” of the words

“two hundred and fifty”.

Amenen 18 Section 30 of the Principal Ordinance is hereby amended

f i 30 . S « 35
of Chapier by the substitution for the words “one hundred and twenty” of the
298.

words “two hundred”.



A.D. 1962] TAX (AMENDMENT) [No. 8 15

. 8. Subsection (1) of section 39 of the Principal Ordinance
is hereby amended —

(a) by the substitution for the words “five hundred and fifty”
of the words “seven hundred”;

(b) by the substitution for the words “four hundred and
eighty” of the words “six hundred”;

(c) by the substitution for the words “one hundred and
seventy” of the words “two. hundred”;

(d) by the substitution for the words “one hundred and
twenty” wherever they appear of the words “one hundred

and fifty”.
9. Section 42 of the Principal Ordinance is hereby repealed
and the following section substituted therefor:—

S TP 42. . The duty for an annual spirit shop licence
35 of 194, shall be. if it is in Georgetown or within a
e mile of the municipal boundaries thereof. or in
New Amsterdam, the sum of six hundred
dollars and if situate elsewhere the sum of two

_hundred dollars.”
10. Section 45 of the Principal Ordinance is hereby repealed

and the following substituted therefor:—
e 45. The duty for an annual restaurant liquor
23 of 1952, licence shall be, if the restaurant is situate in
s 8 the city of Georgetown or within a mile of the
municipal boundaries thereof or in New Am-
sterdam, the sum of six hundred dollars and.
if situate elsewhere, the sum of four hundred

and eighty dollars
1. Any sum which should, by virtue of the provisions of the

Principal Ordinance as amended by this Ordinance, have been paid
prior to the enactment of this Ordinance in respect of any licence
duty hereby increased shall be paid within a period of twenty-eight
days after such enactment:

Provided that the licensee shall be credited with any amount paid
prior to such enactment in respect of his licence for 1962 and, not-
withstanding that apy amount so paid be less than ‘the sum which
should have been paid as aforesaid, the payment of such less amount
shall, in the absence of any failure to pay the said sum in accordance
with the provisions of this section, be deemed to have had, and to
have, effect as if such amount were equal to the said sum.

12.(1) Sections 2, 3 and 4 of this Ordinance shall be deemed to
have come into operation on the 31st day of January, 1962:
Provided that —

(a) notwithstanding anything to the contrary provided
Cap. 303. in sections 29, 31 and 33 of the Stamp Duties
(Management) Ordinance, no person shall be liable

Amendment
of section 39
of Chapter
298.

Repeal and
re-enactment
of section 42
of Chapter
208.

Repeal and
re-enactment
of section 45
of Chapter
298.

Transitionat
provisions.

Commence-
ment,



16 No. 8] THE LAWS OF BRITISH GUIANA [A.D. 1962

(b)

to any penalty under such provisions in respect of
any instrument executed prior to the enactment of
this Ordinance and which, by reason only of the
coming into operation of section 4 of this Ordi-
nance, is not duly stamped;

no criminal proceedings shall be instituted against
any person in respect of any instrument where
prior to the enactment of this Ordinance, by rea-
son only of the coming into operation of section 4
of this Ordinance, such instrument is not duly
stamped.

(2) Sections 5, 6, 7, 8, 9 and 10 of this Ordinance shall be
deemed to have come into operation on the 1Ist day of January, 1962.

Passed by the Legislative Assembly on the 30th April, 1962.

Passed by the Senate on the 28th May, 1962.

(L.A. Bill 5/1962).

I. CRUM EWING,
Clerk of the Legislature.



