


AN ACT to :nd the Summary Jurisdiction (Offences) Act.

A.D. 1997 Enacted by the Parliament of Guyana:—
Short title. 1.  This Act, which amends the Summary 1irisdiction
Cap. 8:02 (Offences) Act, may be cited as the Summary Jurisdiction
(Offences) (Amendment) Act 1997,
ﬁ.tm:gdment 2. The sections of the Principal Act mentioned in the first
Principal column of the Schedule are hereby amended in the manner
Act. specified in the corresponding entry in the second column of the
Schedule
SCHEDULE
S.2
SECTIONS AMENDMENTS
Section 14 (a) For “five thousand” substitute “‘forty-ninc
thousand™.
{b) Substitute for the proviso the following proviso —
“Provided that where the conviction is in
respect of offence commiticd prior (o
the coming ...to operation of the Summary
Jurisdictio ffences) (Amendment) Act
1997 the ensation awarde shall not
exceed the iount which the court could
have awa at the time of the com-
mission of tne offence.”.
Section 21 For “three hundred and seventy-five™ substitute “five
thousand™,
Section 22 For “onc thousand™ substitute “seven thousand five
hundred”.
Section 23 For “one thousand” substitute “seven thousand five
hundred™.
Section 25 For “one thousand™ substitute “seven thousand five
hundred™.
Section 26 For *“seven hundred and fifty” substitute “five

thousand”.



3

SCHEDULE
SECTIONS AMENDMENTS
Section 27 For “one thousand” substitute “five thousand”.
Section 28 For “one thousand” substitute “ten thousand”. .
Seéction 29 For “one thousand” substitute “fifteen thousand’ .
Section 42 For “three hundred” substitute “five thousand”.
Section 43 For “six hundred” substitutc “seven thousand five
hundred”.
Section 45 For “two thousand five hundred” su#bstitufe “fifteen
thousand” and for “three hundred” substitute “five
thousand”. ,
Section 47 (a) For “one hundred” substitute “one thousand”.
Marginal note (b) For “100.” substitute “1,000.”
to section 47
Section 48 (a) For “two thousand” substitute “ten thousand”,
Marginal note {b) For “2,000.” “substitute $10,000.”,
to section 48
Section 49 (a) For “one hundred dollars” substitute “ten thous-

Marginal note
to section 49

Section 50
Section 51

Section 52

Section 53

and dollars” and for “three thousand” substitute “ten
thousand”,

(b} For “100.” substitute “10,000.”.

For “three hundred” substitute “ten thousand”.

For “one hundred and fifty” substitute “seven thous-
and five hundred”.

For “four hundred and fifty” substitute “‘twenty
t_housand” and for “one thousand” substitute “thirtv-
five thousand”.

For “two thousand” substitute “ten thousand”.



4
SCHEDULE

SECTIONS

Al INDMENTS

——— e — s

Scction 54

Section 55

Section 56

Section 57
Section 58
Section 59

Section 60

Section 61

Seetion 62

Section 66

Section 67

For “two thousand™ substitute “‘seven thousand five
hundred”.

For “four thousand” wherever those words occur sub-
stitute “twenty thousand”.

For “three hundred and seventy-five” substitute
“three thousand”.

For “one thousand” substitute “twenty thousand™.
For “two thousand” substitute “ten thousand™.
For “six hundred’ substitute “ten thousand™.

For *“‘two thousand™ substitute ““ten thousand” and
for “three thousand™ substitute ““fiftecn thousand™.

For “two thousand” substitute “ten thousand™ and for
“three thousand” substitute “fifteen thousand™.

For “three hundred and seventy-five™ substitute “‘five
thousand™.

(a) For “five thousand” substitute “thirty {housand™.

(b) In paragraph (a), for “seven thousand five hur
dred” substitute “forty thousand”,

(c) In paragraph (b), for “five thousand” substitute
“twenty-five thousand”.

(d) In paragraph (c), “for five thous d” substituic
“twenty-five thousand”,

(a) For “five thousand” substitute “thirty thousand”.

(b) In paragraph (a), for “five thousand” substitute
“twenty-five thousand”.

{c) In paragraph (b), for “five thousand™ substitute
“twenty-five thousand™.






SCHEDULE
SECTIONS AMENDMENTS
Section 84 (a) For “five thousand™ subsitute “thirty thousand™.

Marginal note
to section 84

Section 85
Section 86
Section 87

Marginal note
to section 87

Section 88
Section 89

Section 90

Section 91

Section 92

(b) For “$5000.” substitute <$30,000.”.

For “five thousand™ substituie “thirly thousand™.
For “five hundred™ substitute “twenty thousand™.
(a) For “five thousand’ substitute “thirty thousand™.

(b) For “$5000.” substitute *$30,000.”.

For “five thousand™ substitute “thirty thousand™.

(a) For “five thousand™ substitute “thirty thousand™.

(b) In paragraph (a), for “‘seven thousand five hun-
dred” substitute “forty thousand™,

(c) In paragraph (b), for “‘seven thousand five hun-
dred” substitute “forty thousand”.

For “five hundred” substitute "seven thousand five
hundred”.

(a) For “five thousand™ substitute “‘thirty thousand™.

(b) In paragraph (a), for “seven thousand five hun-
dred” substitute “forty thousand”,

(¢} In paragraph (b), for “seven thousand five hun-
dred” substitute “forty thousand”.

(a) In subsection (1), for “five thousand™ ~1'e(iture
“thirty thousand”.

(b) In subsection (i) (i), for “‘seven thousand five
hundred”™ substitute “forty thousand”.



7

SCHEDULE
SECTIONS AMENDMENTS
(c) In subsection (1) (ii), for “seven thousand five
hundred” substitute “forty thousand”. :
Section 93 (a) For “five thousand” substitute “thirty thousand”,

Section 94 (1)

Section 94 (2)

Section 95
Section 97

Section 98

Section 99

(a) For “five thousand” substitute “thirty thousand.”

(b) In paragraph (a), for “seven thousand five hun-
dred” substitute “forty thousand”.

(c) In paragraph (b), for “seven thousand five hun-
dred” substitute ‘“forty thousand”.

(a) In paragraph (a); for “seven thousand five hun-
dred” substitute “forty thousand”.

(b) In paragraph (b), for “five thousand” substitute
“twenty thousand”

(c) In paragraph (c), for “five thousand” substltute
“twenty thousand”.

(a) In paragraph (a), for “five thousand” substitute
“twenty thousand”.

(b) In paragraph (b), for “five thousand” substitute
“twenty thousand”.

For “five thousand” substitute ‘“fifteen thousand”.

For “one thousand five hundred” substitute- “fifteen
thousand™.

For “one thousand f1ve hundred” substltute “flfteen
thousand”,

(a) For “five thousand™ substitute “thirty thousand”.

(b) In paragraph (a), for “five thousand” substitute
“twenty thousand”’.

(c) In paragraph (b), for “five thousand” substttute
“twenty thousand”.



8
SCHEDULE

[

SECTIONS

AMENDMENTS

Marginal note
to section 99

Section 100
r Section 101 (1)
Section 102
Section 103

Section 105 {2)

Section 113

Section 116
Section 126
Section 127

Section 128
Section 129 (2
Section 130 (2)

Section 131
Section 133
Section 134 (1)

Section 135

Section 136

(d) For $5000.” substitute *$30,000.”,

For **four thousand” substitute “twenty thousand”.
For “five thousand™ substitute “thirty thousand”.
For “five thousand™ substitute “thirty thousand”.
For “five thousand™ substitute “fifteen thousand”.

For “five thousand™ substitute “twenty-five thous-
and”.

For ‘‘one thousand five hundred” substitute “fifteen
thousand”.

For “‘three hundred” substitute “five 1iousand’.
For “one thousand” substitute “‘ten thousand’.

Fcr “one thousand five hundred” substitute “fifteen
thousand”.

For “two thousand’ substitute “fifteen thousand’.
For “one thousand™ substitute “fifteen thousand”.

For “five hundred” substitute “seven thousand five
hundred”.

For *“five hundred” substitute “five thousand’.
For “two thousand” substitute “fifteen thousand™,

For *“‘three hundred” substitute “seven thousand five
hundred”.

For “one thousand five hundred™ substitute “ten
thousand”.

“For “one thousand five hundred” s stitute “1en
thousand”.



9
SCHEDULE

SECTIONS AMENDMENTS

Section 137 For “two thousand” substitute “fifteen thousand”.

Section 139 For “five hundred” -substitute “seven thousand five
hundred”.

Section 140 For “five hundred” substitute “ten thousand”. N

Section 141 For “five hundred” substitute “ten thousand”

Section 1493 For “oﬁe thousand’ substitute “seven thousand five
hundred™.

Section 144 (1) For one thousand five hundred” substitute “ten
thousand’’. :

Section 145(2) 1(b) For “three hundred dollars™ substitute “ten thousand
dollars”.

Section 145 (4) For “seven thousand five hundred” substitute “fifteen
thousand™.

Section 145 (5) For “one thousand five hundred” substitute “seven
thousand five hundred”.

Section 150 (1) For “two thousand” substitute “fifteen thousand”.

Section 151 (1) For “one thousand” substitute “ten thousand” and
for “four thousand” substitute “fifteen thousand”.

Section 153 (1) For ‘““one thousand” substitute “seven thousand five
hundred”, .

Section 156 For “one thousand five hundred” substitute ‘“ten
thousand™’. ‘

Section 157 For “five thousand” substitute “twenty five thous-

‘ and”.
Section 160 (2) Fér “three hundred” substitute “five thousand”.

Section 161 For “three hundred” substitute “five thousand”,




10
SCHEDULE

SECTIONS

AMENDMENTS

Section 162

Secticn 183

Secion 165 (1)

Section 166

Section 169

Seciien 171 (1)

Section 172 (2)

Section 173
Section 174A

Section 176 (1)

Section 179
Section 180
Section 181
Section 182

Section 188

For “‘one thousand” substitute “seven thousand five
hundred”.

For “one thousand™ gubctituie “ceven {housand five
hundred™.

(a) For ‘“five thousand™ «nbstitute “fifteen thousand’ .
(b) For “seven thousar five hundred™ substitute
“thirty thousand”.

For “three thousand™ substitute “fifteen thousand”.

For “one thousand five hundred™ substitute “fiftcen
thousand™.

For “one thousand™ substitute “ten thousand™.

For “one hundred ai d fifty” substitute “five thous-
and”.

For “three hundred™ s. bstitute “ten thousand™.

(a) For “one thousand™ substi{uie “seven thousand
five hundred™.

{b) For “two thousand™ substitute “ten thousand™.

For “one thousand five hundred™ substitute “‘seven
thousand five hundred”.

For “one thousand™ substitute “five thousand.
For “one thousand™ substitute “five thousand™
For “three thousand” substitute “ten thousand™.

(@) For “fifty” substitute “two thousand five hun-
dred”.

(b) For “one hundred” substitute “five thousand”.

For “one hundred” substitute “two thousand five
hundred”,



11
SCHEDULE

SECTIONS

AMENDMENTS

Section 186 (2)

Section 187 (1)

Section 194 (1)
Section 195
Section 196

Section 197
Section 198

Section 199 (3)
Section 200
Section 201
Section 204

Section 205

For ‘“‘seven hundred” substitute “five thousand” and
for “five hundred” substitute “three thousand”.

(a) For “seventy” substitute “five thousand™.
(b) For “four hundred” substitute “ten thousand”.

For “five thousand” wherever those words occur
substitute “twenty-five thousand”.

For “two thousand” substitute “twenty-five thousand”
and for “one thousand” substitute “fifteen thousand”.

For “one thousand five hundred” substitute “ten
thousand”,

For “three thousand” substitute “fifteen thousand”.

For “three thousand substitute “seven thousand five
hundred”.

For “five thousand” substitute “fifteen thousand”.
For “two thousand” substitute “fifteen rthousandf’.
For “two thousand” substitute “ten thousand”.

For “five thousand” substitute “thirty thousand”.

For “one thousand” substitute “five thousand”.

EXPLANATORY MEMORANDUM

This Bill seeks to amend the Summary Jurisdiction (Offences) Act, Cap.
8:02, to increase the prescribed fines. These fines, inspite of the increases in
1989, are so inordinately low that they are almost derisory. This has been due
to inflation and the fall of the Guyana dollar. Hence the fines are now being
increased to realistic levels so that they may serve as true deterrents.

Bernard C. De Santos,
Attorney General and Minister of Legal Affairs.





