EXTRACTS DATED 19" DECEMBER, 2016

GUYANA No. 9 of 2016

REGULATIONS
Made Under
THE CUSTOMS ACT
(Cap. 82:01)

IN EXERCISE OF THE POWERS CONFERRED UPON ME BY SECTION 275
OF THE CUSTOMS ACT, | MAKE THE FOLLOWING REGULATIONS: -

Citation and 1. These Regulations which amend the Customs Regulations may be cited as the
commencement. Customs (Amendment) Regulations 2016, and shall come into operation on
the 1st February, 2017.

Amendment of 2. The Principal Regulations are amended as follows ~
the Principal
Regulations

(a) in regulation 91, by the substitution for the word “granted.” of the
words “granted; the fees payable under this regulation shall be
'$6,000.”;

(b) in regulation 106(5), by the substitution —

(i) in sub-paragraph (a) for the words “$5000” of the words
“$20,0007;

(iiy in sub-paragraph (b) for the words “$3,500” of the words
“$15,0007; and ,

(ii) in sub-paragraph (c) for the words “$2,500” of the words
“$10,0007;

(c) by the insertion in regulation 106 of the following paragraph —
“(6) Thefee for clearance of coastal vessels is $2000.”;

(d) in regulation 144 -

(i) by numbering regulation 144 as regulation 144(1);

(i) for entering fees and clearing fees, by the substitution for the
words “$500”, of the words “$2,0007,

(ili)by the insertion of the following as sub-regulation (2) -



768 THE OFFICIAL GAZETTE [Licat SupeLement] — B 19" DECEMBER, 2016

*(2) The administrative fee for processing Customs
Forms C21, C25, C68, and C72 shall be
$1,000.”;

(e) in regulation 173, by the substitution for the words “four dollars” of
the words “four thousand dollars”;

H in regulation 174, by the substitution —

(i) in sub-regulation (2), for the words “twenty five
dollars” of the words “four thousand dollars™ and in
the proviso for the words “fifteen dollars” of the words
“four thousand dollars”,

(ii) in sub-regulation (3), for the words “five dollars”
ofthe words “four thousand dollars™;

(iii) in sub-regulations (4) and (5), for the words “fifteen
dollars” of the words “four thousand dollars™;

(2)  in regulation 202, by the substitution for the words “$3000” of the
words “$15,0007;

(h)  in regulation 204C, by the substitution for the words “two hundred
and fifty dollars” of the words “five thousand dollars”; and

(i) by the insertion of the following regulation -

“Other fees. 208. Thereshall be a fee of $500 for a Customs seal.”.

Made mis\ﬂ day of December 2016.

Hgn. Winston Jordan, MP
Minister of Finance



	Page 1
	Page 2

