
• THE OFFICIAL GAZETTE 7TH  JULY, 2005 
LEGAL SUPPLEMENT B 

Regulations No. 10 of 2005 	 Thursday 7th  July, 2005 

GUYANA 	 No. 10 of 2005 

REGULATIONS 

Made Under 

VALUATION FOR RATING PURPOSES ACT 

(Cap.28:04) 

citation 

1N EXERCISE OF THE POWERS CONFERRED UPON ME BY SECTION 41 OF 
THE VALUATION FOR RATING PURPOSES ACT, I HEREBY MAKE 
THE FOLLOWING REGULATIONS: - 

1. 	These Regulations, which amend the Valuation for Rating Purposes 

Regulations 1972*, may be cited as the Valuation for Rating Purposes 

(Amendment) Regulations 2005. 

Amendment of 	2. 	The provisions of the Principal Regulations specified in the first column of 
the Principal 

Regulations. 	the Schedule are hereby amended in the manner specified in the corresponding 

entry in the second column of the Schedule. 

Cap 28:04 Subsidiary Legislation 



890 	 THE OFFICIAL GAZETTE [LEGAL. SUPPLFMENT] 	- B 	 7" JULY, 2005 

2 

Reg. 2 

SCHEDULE 

Provision How amended 

Reg. 3 (2) For the words "two dollars" substitute the words "two thousand 

dollars". 

Reg.5 Delete the words "the appropriate" and the words "or form 4" 

Reg.8 For the words "fitly cents" substitute the words "four thousand 

dollars". 

SCHEDULE 

Form 1 For the words "Ministry of Co-operatives and National 

Mobilisation, 	D'Urban Park" substitute the words "Ministry of 

Finance, Camp Street" wherever they appear. 

Instructions to Form 1- 
Paragraph 5(6) 	. (1) For the words "one hundred dollars" substitute the words "eight 

thousand dollars" and for the words "ten dollars" substitute the 

words "eight hundred dollars". 

Paragraph 5(7) (2) For the words "five hundred dollars" substitute the words 

"forty thousand dollars". 



S 
THE OFFICIAL GAZETTE [LEGAL SUPPLEMENT] - 	 7TH  JULY, 2005 	 891 

3 

Instructions for 
Preparation of Plan to 
Accompany Return of 
Particulars- 
Paragraph 3(e) 
	

For the word "Hose" substitute the word "House". 

Forms 2, 5, 8, 9, 11, For the words "Ministry of Co-operatives and National 
12 & 15 

Mobilisation, D'Urban Park" substitute the words "Ministry of 

Finance, Camp Street". 

Form 4 
	

Delete 

Form 5 
	

For the words "TWO HUNDRED DOLLARS" substitute the words 

"SIXTEEN THOUSAND DOLLARS". 

Forms 13 & 16 
	

(1) For the words "Ministry of Co-operatives and National • 

Mobilisation, D'Urban Park" substitute the words `Ministry of 

Local Government, Fort Street, Kingston". 

(2) For the words "twenty five dollars" substitute the words "two 

thousand dollars". 

Made this 7th day of July , 2005 

Minister in the Ministry of Local Government and Regional Development 


