
THE OFFICIAL CAZETTE 20TH MARCH, l996 

GUYANA 

LECAL SUPPLEMENT - B 

REGULATIONS 

Made Under 

TilE DEALERS IN FOREIGN CURRENCY 
(LICENSING) ACT 1989 

(No. 19 of 1989) 

No. 3 of 1996 

IN EXERCISE OF THE POWERS CONFERR.BD UPON THE BANK BY 
SECTION 18 OF TilE DEALERS IN FOREIGN CURRENCY 
(LICENSING} ACT, THE BANK HEREBY MAKES THE FOLLOWING 
REGULATIONS:-

1. These Regulations, which amend the Dealers in Foreign 
Currency (Licensing) Regulations 1990*, may be cited as the Dealers 
in Foreign Currency (Licensing) (Amendment) Regulations 1996. 

2. Regulation 4 of the Principal Regulations is hereby 
amended by t1he substitution for the words "one hundred thousand 
dol1ars" in paragraph (2), of the words "two hundred and fifty 
thousand dollars". 

3. Regulation 5 of the Principal Regulations is hereby 
amended by the substitution for the words "one hundred thousand 
do11ars" in oara{lfaph (2), of the words "two hundred and fifty 
thousand dollars" .. 

4. The Schedule to the Principal Regulations is herebY 
amended bY the substitution-

(a) in Form 1 and 2, for the word "Minister", wherever 
it occurs, of the word "Bank"; 

(b) for Form 3, of the fo1Iowing Form -

~'Regulation No. 3 of 1990. 

Citation. 

Amendment 
of reg ·Jlathm 
4 of the 
PrinciPal 

Regulations, 

Amendment 
Of reg latio n 
5 of the 
Principal 

Regulations. 

Amendment 
of Schedule­
to the Prin. 
c:ipaJ Regula­
tions, 



• 

24 THE _9FFICIAL GAZETT~_ LEGAL. SUPPLEMENT - B 20TH MARCH, 1996· 

"FORM 3 

APPLICATION FOR RENEWAL OF LICENCE 
DEALERS IN FOREIGN CURR:ENCY 

(LIOENSING) ACT 1989 

(No. 19 of ·1989) 

1. Applicant's name and address in full. 

reg. 5 

2. Number and date of the licence sought to be renewed. 

3. (a) Whether the above-mentioned licence was previously 
renewed and if so, the date/dates on which the licence 
was renewed over the: last five years. 

~b) Whether an a:pplication for the renewal of the licence 
was refused at any time and if so, the date/dates of re-
fusal. · ' · ' 

' 
4. Premises where the applicant intends to carry on the 

licensed business. 

Dated this day of ' ,19 

Signature of app1icant(s)." . 

Made this day of ' 1996. 

A. L . Meredith~ 
Governor of th~ Bank of Guyana. 


