
-; :.� . -·•,.,-:c ..... -n: . 

A.D. 1950] SUPREME COURT OF JUDICATURE (AMDT.\ (No. 3. u 

I assent. 

C. C. WOOLLEY.

Governor. 

23rd March, 1950. 

ORDINANCE No. 3 OF 1950. 
AN ORDINANCE further to amend the Supreme Court of Judica- A.D. 19S0.

ture Ordinance. 
[28th March, 1950. 

Be it enacted by the Governor of British Guiana, with 
the advice and consent of the Legislative Council thereof, as 
follows:--

1. This Ordinance may be cited as the Supreme Court of Short title.
,Tudicature (Amendment) Ordinance, 1950, and shall be construed 
and read as one with the Supreme Court of Judicature Ordinance, C 10 hereinafter referred to as the Principal Ordinance, and any ap.

amending Ordinance. 



6 No. 3.] 

Amend­
ment of 
Section 
6 of the 
Principal 
Ordinance. 
No. 32 of 
1936. 

Amend­
ment of 
section 8 
of the 
Principal 
Ordinance. 

Amend­
ment of 
section 52 
of the 
Principal 
Ordinance. 

1.'HE LAWS OF BRITISH GUIANA [A.D. 1950. 

2. Section six of the Principal Ordinance, as repealed and
replaced by section tvrn of the Supreme Ccurt of Judicature 
(Amendment) Ordinance, 1936, is hereby amended -

(a) by the substitution for the words "not more than
three" of the words "not more than four"; and

(b) by the substitution for the words "the First and
Second Puisne Judges" of the words "the First,
Second and Third Puisne Judges".

3. Section eight of the Principal Ordinance as amended from
time to time is hereby further amended -

(a) by the substitution in subsection (1) for the words
"five thousand three hundred", and the words
"twenty-five thousand four hundred and forty"
of the words "six thousand eight hundred" and
.;thirty-two thousand six hundred and forty"
respectively; and

(b) by the insertion in subsection (2) after the
seventh line thereof, of the words -

"to the Third Puisne Judge a salary not 
exceeding fifteen hundred pounds;". 

4. Section fifty-two of the Principal Ordinance is hereby
amended -

(a) by the substitution for the words "one hundred
dollars" of the words "two hundred and fifty
dollars"· and

(b) by the 'substitution for the symbol and figures
"$100" in the marginal note thereto, of the symbol
and figures "$250".

.. 


