Bill Ne. 3.

PUBLISHED 26ta JANUARY, 19£6.

No. 138
« GOVERNMENT NOTICE.

LEGISLATURE,
Public Buildings,
Georgetown, Dcmerara.
26th January, 1956.
The following bi)l which will be introduced in the Legislative
Council is published for general information.

L J. FARIA,

Acting Clerk of the Legislature.
BILL No. 3 of 1956.

A BILL
INTITULED

AN ORDINANCE FURTHER TO AMEND THE CIVIL LIST OR-
DINANCE BY INCREASING THE AMOUNT WHICH
SHALL BE PAYABLE TO HER MAJESTY FOR DEFRAY-
ING THE EXPENSES OF CERTAIN SERVICES.

Enacted by the Legislature of British Guiana: —

1.- This Ordinance may be cited as the Civil List (Amend-
ment) Ordinance, 1956, and shall be construed and read as one
with the Civil List Ordinance, hereinafter referred to as the Prin-
cipal Ordinance, and any Ordinance amending the same.

2. Section 2 of the Principal Ordinance as amended by the
Civil List (Amendment) Ordinance, 1955, is hereby further
amended by the substitution for the words “forty nine thousand
eight hundred and fifty” of the words “fifty-two thousand eight
hundred and fifty”.

3. Section 4 of the Principal Ordinance as amended by the
Civil List (Amendment) Ordinance, 1955, is hereby further
amended by the substitution for the words “forty-nine thousand
eight hundred and fifty” of the words “fifty-two thousand eight
hundred and fifty”.

4. The schedule to the Principal Ordinance as substituted by
section 4 of the Civil List (Amendment) Ordinance, 1955, is
hereby amended —

(a) by the insertion between the item “The Registrar
of Deeds” and the item ‘“Magistrates on the scale
£950 x £50 — £1,450” of the following new
item — “2 Senior Maglstrates 3,000”;

(b) by the substitution for the total “£49,850” of the
total “£52,850”.

6. This Ordinance shall be deemed to have come into opera-
tion on the 1st January, 1956.

OBJECTS AND REASONS

This Bill seeks to give effect to certain recommendations for
the increase in the number of posts and in the amount provided
in the Civil List Establishment specified in clause 4 of the Bill.

" F. D. JAKEWAY,

Chief Secretary.
(M.P. C. 231/1 III).
(Leg. Bill No. 3/1956).

Short title.

Cap. 68.

Amendment
of section 2
of the Prin-
cipal Ordin-
ance.

No. 22
1955.

of

Amendment
of section 4
of the Prin-
cipal Ordin-
anece.

No. 22 of

1955,

Amendment
of the sche-
dule to the
Principal
Ordinance.
No. of
1955.

22

Commence-
ment.



	Page 1
	Page 2



