Bill No. 29 PUBLISHED 911 JUNE, 1956.

No. 1,057

Bill No. 29 of 1956.

ARRANGEMENT OF SECTIONS.
Section. i

1 Short title.
2 Amendment of section 3 of the Principal Ordinance.

3 Commencement.
A BILL
' Intituled
AN ORDINANCE FURTHER TO AMEND THE AUDIT DEPART-
MENT ORDINANCE FOR THE PURPOSE OF INCREASING

THE SALARIES OF THE DIRECTOR OF AUDIT AND THE

SENIOR AUDITOR.

Enacted by the Legislature of British Guiana:—

1. This Ordinance may be cited as the Audit Department
(Amendment) Ordinance, 1956, and shall be construed and read
as one with the Audit Department Ordinance, hereinafter referred Capr- 69.
to as the Principal Ordinance, and any Ordinance amending the
same.

2. Section 3 of the Principal Ordinance as amended from
time to time is hereby further amended — oAfnggtﬁima

(a) by the substitution for the words “three thousand two ot the Prin-
hundred” appearing in subsection (1) of the words cipal Ordin-
“three thousand three hundred”; g

(b) by the substitution for the words “one thousand seven
hundred and fifty” appearing in paragraph (a) of
subsection (2) of the words “one thousand eight
hundred”;

(¢) by the substitution for the words “one thousand four
hundred and fltty” appearing in paragraph (b) of
subsection (2) of the words “one thousand five hundred”. -
3. This Ordinance shall be deemed to have come 1nto opera-
tion on the 1st January, 1954. Commence-
OBJECTS AND REASONS o
This Bill seeks to give effect to certain recommendations for
the revision of the emoluments of the Dlrector of Audit and the
Senior Auditor,

Short title.

' M. S. PORCHER,
Actlng Chief Secretary

(C.M.P. 7/3)
(Leg. Bill No. 29/1956). "




	Page 1

