BILL No. 10 of 1997 Saturday, 14th June, 1997

PARLIAMENT OFFICE,
Public Buildings,
Georgetown,
Guyana.

10th June, 1997.

The following Bill whieh will be introduced in the National Assembly
is published for general information.

F. A. Nerain,
Clerk of the National Assembly.

-1 9’\&!

GUYANA

BILL No. 10 of 1997

SUMMARY JURISDICTION (PROCEDURE) (AMENDMENT)
BILL 1997

ARRANGEMENT OF SECTIONS

SECTION .
1. Short title.
2 Amendment of section 37 of the Principal Act.
43. Atneridfiiént of sectioh 38 of the Principal Act.

pal
Athefidiitent of seetiofi 1 of the Principg] Act.




40

A.D: 1597

Short title.
Cap. 10:02

Amendment
of section
37 of the
Principal
Act

Amendment
of section
38 of the
Principal
Act.

Amendment
of section
61 of the
Principal
Act.

2

A BILL
Intituled

AN ACT to amend the Summary Jurisdiction (Procedure) Act.

“ Enacted by the Parliament of Guyana:—

1. This Act, which amends the Summary Jurisdiction (Proce-
dure) Act, may be cited as the Summary Jurisdiction (Procedure)
(Amendment) Act 1997.

2. Section 37 of the Principal Act is hereby amended by

the substitution for the words “seven thousand” of the words “forty
thousand”, .

3. Section 38 of the Principal Act is hereby amended by the
substitution for the words appearing immediately after the word:
“order” and ending with the words “six months™ of the following—
“does not exceed $5,000 ten days;

exceeds $5,000, but does
not exceed $7,500 .. twenty-one days;

exceeds $7,500, but does
not exceed $15,000 ... six weeks;

exceeds $15,000, but does

not, exceed $25,000, ... three months;
exceeds $25,000, but does

not exceed $35,000 ... five months;
exceeds $35,000, . nine months;

4. Section 61 of the Principal Act is hereby amended by the
substitution in the proviso to subsetion (1) thereof for the words
“fifteen thousand” of the words “fifty thousand.”

EXPLANATORY MEMORANDUM

. This Bill seeks to amend certain penalty provisions of the Summary
Jurisdiction (Procedure) Act, Cap. 10:02. The amendments have become neces-
sary in view of the fact that hyperinflation and the falling value of Guy-



- o~

3

anese currency have made the existing fines under the Act to be insufficient.
The Bill is, therefore, intended to effect increases in the fines 30 as to bring
such fines in line with the evonomic realities of the country.

Bernard C. De Santos,
Attorney-General and Minister of Legal Affairs.



