
THE OFFICIAL CAZETTE 7TH NOVEMBER, 1998 
LEGAL SUPPLEMENT - C 

PARLIAMENT OFFICE, 
Public Buildings, 

Oeorgeto\VD, 
Guyana. 

3rd N()vetncbr, 1998. 

The following Bill which will be introduced in the National Assembly is 
published for general information. 

SECTION 

1..:1!,. 
~ 

F. A. Ntll'aifl, 
Clerk of the National Assembly. 

CUYANA 

BILL No. 14 of 1998 

PREVENTION OF CRIMES (AMENDMENT) BILL 1998 

ARRANGEMENT OF SECTIONS 

1. Short title. 
2. Amendment of the Principal Act. 



416 THE OFFICIAL GAZETTE [LEGA.t. SoPPLEMENT] -C 7TH Nov.; 1938 

A.D.rl~ 

Short ti1Jle, 

Cap. 9:01 

A.BILL 

latituled 

AN ACT to amend the Prevention of Crimes Act. 

Enacted by the Parliament of Guyana:-

1. This Act, which amends the Prevention of Crimes 
Act, may be cited as the Prevention of Crimes (Amendment Act 
1998. 

2. The sections of the Principal Act mentioned in the 
first column of the Schedule are hereby amended in tlie manner 
sPecified in the corresponding entry in the second column of the 
Schedule. 

FIRST COLUMN 
SECTIONS 

Section 7 

Section 8 

Section 9 

Sectton 12 

SCHEDULE S.2 

SECOND COLUMN 
.AMENDMENTS 

For "seven thousand five hundred 
dollars" substitute "fifteen thousand 
dollars". for "fifteen tJhousand dollars" 
substitute "thirty thousand dollars", 
for "one month" substitute "two 
months" and for "three months". sub­
stitute "six months". 

In paragraph (b), for "fifteen thousand 
dollars" substitute "thirty thousand 
dollars". 

In subsection (2), for seven thousand 
five hundred dollars" substitute "not 
less than seven thousand five hundred 
dollars nor more than fifteen thousand 
dollars" and for "ten thousand dollars" 
substitute "not less t!han ten thousand 
dollars nor more than twenty thousand 
dollars''. 

(a) In subsection (1) (a), for "twenty 
thousand dollars" substitute ''not less 
than twenty thousand dollars nor more 
than forty thousand dollars" and for 
"six months" substitute "twelve 
months." 



7th Nov.; 1998 THE OFFICIAL GAZETTE [LEGA.L SUPPLEMENT) -C 417 

FIRST COLUMN 
SECTIONS 

Section 1'5 

Section 16 

Section 1'8 

(b) 

SECOND COLUMN 
AMENDMENTS 

In subsection (1) (b), for "two years" 
substitute "four years' . 

In subsection (4). for 1·fifteen thousand 
dollars" substitute "not less than 
fifteen thousand dollars" nor more than 
"thirty thousand dollars" and for 
"three months" substitute "six 
months". 

In subsection (2), for "fifteen thousand 
dollars" substitute "thirty thousand 
dollars", for "forty thousand dollars" 
substitute "eighty thousand dollars", 
for "three months" substitute six 
mon1Jhs" and for "six months'' substi­
tute ''twelve months". 

For "thirty thousand dollars"' substi­
tute "not less than thirty thousand 
dollars" nor more than sixty thousand 
dollars" and for "four months" substi­
tute eight months". 

EXPLANATORY MEMORANDUM 

. The ~ct which . this Bill amends was. amended in 1997 to increase pen( 
alt1es. It 1s now bemg amended to provide for a minimum benchmark for 
each offence and to increase custodial sentences. 

C. Ramson, 
Attorney-General and Minister of Legal Afiairs. 


	New Profile_9.PDF
	Page 1

	New Profile_4.PDF
	Page 1




